STATE OF ALABAMA SURFACE TREATMENT
CHAMBERS COUNTY Bid Inquiry No. 1583
CHANMBERS COUNTY COMMISSION 2015-2016
LAFAYETTE, ALABAMA
CHARLES E. WATTS INC
401B-117 Bituminous b
[w/ polymer additive} GRANITE  LIMESTONE GRANITE LIMESTONE GRANITE  LIMESTONE
STRIP PATCHING 48.59 no bid
0-11750 8¥ $2.94 no bid
11750-58750 SY $1.59 no bid
58750-117500 SY $1.49 no bld
117560 S5¥ AND ABOVE $1.37 no bid
4018-111 Bituminous G
(w/ polymer additive) GRAMITE LIMESTONE GRANITE UMESTONE GRANITE  LIMESFONE
STRIP PATCHING $9.47 no bid
011750 5¥ $3.37 no hid
11750-58750 SY $1.98 no bid
58750-117500 5Y $1.89 no bid
117500 SY AND ABOVE $1.82 no bid
401B-118 Bitumious GD
{w/ polymer additive) GRANITE  LIMESTONE GRANITE  LIMESTONE GRANITE  LIMESTONE
STRIP PATCHING $9.62 na bid
0-11750 Y $6.76 no bid
11750-58750 5Y $4.18 o bid
58750-117500 SY 53.82 no hid
117500 5Y AND ABOVE 53.80 nobid
401B-106 Bitumious IG
{(w/polymer additive} GRANITE  LIMESTONE GRANITE  LMESTONE GRANITE  LIMESTONE
0-1.750 5Y $6.80 no bid
11750-58750 SY $4.05 no bld
58750-117500 S¥ $3.94 no bid
117500 SY AND ABOVE $3.92 no bid
401B-107 Bitumious KG
(w/polymer additive) GRANITE  LIMESTONE GRANITE LIMESTONE GRANITE  LIMESTONE
0-11750 8Y $6.95 na bid
11750-58750 SY $4.25 no bid
58750-117500 SY 44.15 na bid
117500 SY AND ABOVE $4.13 na bid
409A-001 Triple Layer
Bitumninous Treatment GRANITE  LIMESTONE GRANITE  LIMESTONE GRANITE  UMESFONE
0-11750 ¥ $6.80 no bid
11750-58750 Y $4.20 no bid
58750-117500 SY $3.84 no bid
117560 5Y AND ABOVE $3.82 o bid
404G-001 Pavement Surfacing
(Scrub Seal) GRANITE  LIMESTONE GRANITE LIMESTONE GRANITE  LIMESTONE
£-11752 5Y $3.49 no bid
11750-5375G SY $2.61 no bid
58750-117500 SY 5202 no blg
117500 SY AND ABOVE $1.94 no bid
RECOMMENDATION NO RESPONSE

CHARLES E. WATTS, INC.

CHRIS CLARK, MCCARTNEY CONST.,
CALHOUN ASPHALT,NORRIS
PAVING,S&C MATERIALS

AWARDED BY COMMISSION:




